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List Individual Bidders

The Railroad Yard 12.45 17.25 2450 |24.95| 35.45 | 43.00 43.00 | 85.00 | 135.00 | 225.00 | 215.00 | 215.00 | 215.00
Wheeler Metals 10.00 19.00 28.00 | 22.00 | 40.00 | 50.00 | Nobid | 65.00 | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid
24.90 | 39.00 | 49.00 43.50 | 89.00 | 145.00 | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid

Sunbelt Equipment and Supply 1250 | 1875 | 25.50
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List Individual Bidders
The Railroad Yard 225.00 | 190.00 | 225.00 | 215.00 | 215.00 | 215.00 | 225.00 | 190.00
Wheeler Metals No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid
No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid

Sunbelt Equipment and Supply




