AWARDED TO: Ergon Asphalt; Coastal Energy; Wright Asphalt; Asphalt and Fuel Supply
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List Individual Bidders
Vance Brothers . . . ) . ) 2.20 2.00 . . . . ) .
Tulsa, OK No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid Tulsa Tulsa No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Coastal Energy Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid Nobid | No bid
Willow Springs, MO
Ergon Asphaltand Emulsions | o0 | o big 1.49 No bid 1.65 1.78 1.80 1.35 2.20 1.35 1.70 2.00 2.35 235
Catoosa, OK
Wright Asphalt Nobid | Nobid | 1.80 2.05 Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | 1.50 | Nobid | No bid Nobid | No bid
Tulsa, OK
Asphalt and Fuel Supply Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid Nobid | No bid

Tulsa, OK
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List Individual Bidders
Vance Brothers . 70.00 / Hr.
Tulsa, OK No bid 75.00 | Aol free hrs. 48,000 Ibs.
Coastal Energy . . . :
g i No bid No bid No bid No bid
Willow Springs, MO 0! 0! 0! o
: 5600
Ergon Asgr‘f" and Emulsions |\ | 70,00 , Jg'ogree Additional freight will be added
atoosa, ' to loads less than 5600 gallons
Wright Asphalt . 2 Hr. Free
Tulsa, OK No bid 75.00 25 00 after
Asphalt and Fuel Supply 2.10 75.00 75.00 5500 Gal.

Tulsa, OK
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List Individual Bidders
Vance Brothers Nobid | No bid 2.00 Nobid | Nobid | No bid 1.95 1.85 No bid 1.85 2.15 No bid Nobid | No bid
Tulsa, OK
Coastal Energy Nobid | No bid 1.45 No bid 1.73 1.89 1.74 1.49 No bid 1.30 1,68 No bid 1.74 1,62
Willow Springs, MO
Ergon ASphalt and Emulsions No bid No bid 1.54 No bid 1.70 1.83 1.86 1.41 2.26 1.40 1.75 2.06 2.40 2.40
Catoosa, OK
Wright Asphalt Nobid | Nobid | 1.88 2.10 Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid Nobid | 155 | Nobid | No bid Nobid | Nobid
Tulsa, OK
Asphalt and Fuel Supply Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid Nobid | Nobid

Tulsa, OK
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List Individual Bidders
Vance Brothers , 70.00 / Hr.
Tulsa, OK No bid 75.00 | Acero hrs. free 48,000 Ibs.
Co_astal Ene_rgy No bid 20.00 70.00 $475 for loads less
Willow Springs, MO After two hours than 5500 Gal.
Ergon Asphalt and Emulsions No bid No bid No bid No bid
Catoosa, OK
Wright Asphalt . . 2 Hrs. Free
Tulsa, OK No bid No bid 75 after 5500 Gallons
Asphalt and Fuel Supply 215 | 7500 75.00 5500 Gal.

Tulsa, OK




