
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Bid Record 
 

Dept:   DISTRICT 3 - FOB 

 

Req:    BID #12 - Rock 

 

Date:  July 1 – December 31, 2016 
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List Individual Bidders               

Kemp Quarries 
Pryor, OK 

9.75 9.50 6.50 No Bid 6.25 6.25 No Bid 10.50 No Bid No Bid 5.00 6.00 No Bid 14.50 

Witty Materials 
Delaware, OK 

9.25 9.25 7.50 No Bid 6.25 6.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.75 No Bid 9.00 15.00 

Greenhill Materials  
Owasso, OK 

9.25 9.00 6.00 No Bid 6.00 6.00 9.25 9.00 No Bid No Bid 5.00 5.00 No Bid 21.00 

Anchor Stone Co.  
Owasso, OK 

9.00 9.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.25 9.00 9.00 9.00 No Bid 5.00 No Bid 8.50 15.00 

APAC – Oologah Quarry 10.00 10.00 No Bid 7.00 7.00 7.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

APAC – Nowata Quarry 9.00 9.00 No Bid 7.00 7.00 7.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

APAC –Tulsa Quarry 9.50 9.50 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 9.50 9.50 9.50 No Bid 5.25 6.00 9.00 15.00 

APAC - Vinita Quarry 9.75 9.75 6.90 No Bid 6.90 6.90 9.75 9.75 No Bid No Bid 6.00 6.50 8.50 15.00 

Quapaw 
Stillwater, OK 

13.00 12.00 No Bid 10.75 10.75 No Bid No Bid 14.00 14.00 10.00 9.00 No Bid 12.00 No Bid 

AWARDED TO: Kemp Quarries; Greenhill Materials; Anchor Stone; APAC – Tulsa; Quapaw  
 



 

Bid Record 
 

Dept:   FOB 

 

Req:    BID #12 - Rock 

 

Date:  July 1 – December 31, 2016 
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List Individual Bidders 

 

Kemp Quarries 
Pryor, OK 

8.00 8.00 No Bid 7.25 7.50 
24 Hours after 

notice 

Witty Materials 
Delaware, OK 

9.00 8.25 No Bid 6.50 6.50 Now 

Greenhill Materials  
Owasso, OK 

9.75 No Bid 12.00 No Bid 6.50 As needed 

Anchor Stone Co.  
Owasso, OK 

8.50 8.50 No Bid 6.50 6.50 Now 

APAC – Oologah Quarry No Bid 9.00 No Bid 8.00 8.00 
Most products 

available daily 

APAC – Nowata Quarry No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.00 8.00 
Most products 

available daily 

APAC –Tulsa Quarry 8.50 9.00 No Bid 6.50 6.50 
Most products 

available daily 

APAC - Vinita Quarry 8.00 8.50 No Bid 7.50 7.50 
Most products 

available daily 

Quapaw 
Stillwater, OK  

12.00 No Bid No Bid 12.00 No Bid 
Now 

July 1, 2016 

 

 

 


